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PROJECT / Market St. Streetscape Project Bid Opening 5/16/24 11:00 AM
EQUIPMENT Date
GL Fund 16-5251,5252,5253 (TBID) Engineer $1,041,000.00 Budget $1,041,000.00
Estimate
Mah tut B Kell Hanks S. Shafer
BIDDER anoney Stu z, axmeyt-er € er. DMS Contracting | Keeley & Sons | Stutz Excavating . . Shores Builders
Asphalt Excavating Construction Construction Excavating Excavating
BASE BID no bid no bid $1,092,587.77 $1,245,816.77 $1,051,384.30 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $1,092,587.77 $1,245,816.77 $1,051,384.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PENDING
COUNCIL

APPROVAL




